


Government eProcurement System		Government eProcurement System			
Tender Details		Date : 10-Jul-2017 03:04 PM			
 Print					
Basic Details					
Organisation Chain	Council of Scientific and Industrial Research NBRI-LUcknow - CSIR Purchase-NBRI - CSIR				
Tender Reference Number	NBRI/PUR/RC/Consumables/2017				
Tender ID	2017_CSIR_1563_1				
Tender Type	Open Tender	Form of contract	Supply		
Tender Category	Goods	No. of Covers	1		
General Technical Evaluation Allowed	No	ItemWise Technical Evaluation Allowed	No		
Payment Mode	Not Applicable	Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ	No		
Is Multi Currency Allowed For Fee	No				
Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 1					
Cover No	Cover	Document Type	Description		
1	Fee/PreQual/Technical/Finance	.pdf	Annual Rate Contract for the supply of Chemicals, Plasticwares, Glasswares, Gases, Seq ser. etc.		
Other Important Documents					
S.No	Category	Sub Category	Sub Category Description	Format/File	
1	Certificate Details	Bidders Address Format	Bidders Address Format Details		
2	Certificate Details	Income Tax Certificate	Income Tax Certificate Details		
3	Certificate Details	Partnership Deed	Partnership Deed		
4	Certificate Details	Permanent Account Number	Permanent Account Number Details		
5	Certificate Details	Registration Certificate	Registration Certificate Details		
6	Certificate Details	Sales Tax/VAT	Sales Tax/VAT		
7	Certificate Details	Service Tax	Service Tax		
8	Financial Details	Annual Turn over certificates from CA	Annual Turn over certificates from CA		
9	Financial Details	Annual Turn Over Details	Annual Turn Over Details		
10	Financial Details	Audited Profit and Loss Account and Balance Sheet Details for last 3 Years	Audited Profit and Loss Account and Balance Sheet Details for last 3 Years		
11	Financial Details	Bankers Details	Bankers Details		
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]		EMD Fee Details			
Tender Fee in ₹	0.00	EMD Amount in ₹	0.00	EMD Exemption Allowed	No
Fee Payable To	Nil	Fee Payable At	Nil	EMD Fee Type	fixed
Tender Fee Exemption Allowed	No	EMD Payable To	Nil	EMD Percentage	NA
				EMD Payable At	Nil
Work /Item(s)					
Title	Annual Rate Contract for the supply of Research and Development Consumable Items				
Work Description	Annual Rate Contract for the supply of Chemicals, Glasswares, Plasticwares, Gases, Seq.services, etc				
Pre Qualification Details	The bidder must be Manufacturer/OEM/Distributors/Dealers /Stockiest having capabilities to successfully supply the related items under RC				

Independent External Monitor	Not applicable				
Tender Value in ₹	0.00	Product Category	Miscellaneous Goods	Sub category	Consumable Items of Research Lab
Contract Type	Rate Contract	Bid Validity(Days)	90	Period Of Work (Days)	60
Location	CSIR NBRI Lucknow Uttar Pradesh	Pincode	226001	Pre Bid Meeting Place	NA
Pre Bid Meeting Address	NA	Pre Bid Meeting Date	NA	Bid Opening Place	Online in Purchase Section of CSIR NBRI Lucknow

Critical Dates

Publish Date	10-Jul-2017 04:00 PM	Bid Opening Date	11-Aug-2017 10:30 AM
Document Download / Sale Start Date	11-Jul-2017 10:00 AM	Document Download / Sale End Date	10-Aug-2017 10:30 AM
Clarification Start Date	11-Jul-2017 10:00 AM	Clarification End Date	31-Jul-2017 05:00 PM
Bid Submission Start Date	11-Jul-2017 10:00 AM	Bid Submission End Date	10-Aug-2017 10:30 AM

Tender Documents

NIT Document	S.No	Document Name	Description	Document Size (in KB)
	1	Tendernotice_1.pdf	Tender Document for Annual Rate Contract of Research and Development consumables items	727.56
	2	Tendernotice_2.pdf	Tender Notice	512.95

Work Item Documents

S.No	Document Type	Document Name	Description	Document Size (in KB)
1	Tender Documents	Tenderdocument.pdf	Tender Document for Annual Rate Contract	715.06
2	Additional Documents	chemicals.pdf	Upload Price List of Chemical etc (If you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	189.39
3	Additional Documents	plasticwares.pdf	Upload Price list of plasticware etc (if any). (In case you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	180.93
4	Additional Documents	plasticware2.pdf	Upload Additional Price list of Plasticware etc (if any). (In case you do not have additional price list to upload or you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	180.93
5	Additional Documents	arcpricecertificate.pdf	RC Price Certificate to be submitted by bidder	131.97
6	Additional Documents	glasswares.pdf	Upload Price List of Glassware etc (If you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	180.32
7	Additional Documents	sequencingservices.pdf	Upload Additional price list of sequencing services here (if any). In case you do not have any additional price list or do not want to bid	182.25

			under this category then upload a blank pdf page mentioning NO BID under this category	
8	Additional Documents	chemicals2.pdf	Upload Additional Price list of chemicals (if any). (In case you do not have additional price list to upload or you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	189.39
9	Additional Documents	ARCproforma.pdf	RC proforma to be filled by the bidder	149.58
10	Additional Documents	plasticware1.pdf	Upload Additional Price list of Plasticware etc (if any). (In case you do not have additional price list to upload or you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	180.93
11	Additional Documents	filter.pdf	Upload Price list of Filter paper etc(if any). (In case you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	183.59
12	Additional Documents	pipetteliquidhandling.pdf	Upload Price List of Pipette and Liquid Handling items etc If you are not bidding under this category then upload a blank pdf page mentioning NO BID under this category	185.34
13	Additional Documents	pipetteliquidhandling1.pdf	Upload Additional Price list of pipette and liquid handling items etc (if any). (In case you do not have additional price list to upload or you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	185.34
14	Additional Documents	glassware1.pdf	Upload Additional Price list of Glasswares etc (if any). (In case you do not have additional price list to upload or you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	180.32
15	Additional Documents	chemicals1.pdf	Upload Additional Price list of chemicals (if any). (In case you do not have additional price list to upload or you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	189.39
16	Additional Documents	glassware2.pdf	Upload Additional Price list of Glassware etc (if any). (In case you do not have additional price list to upload or you are not applying under this category then upload a	180.32

			blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	
17	Additional Documents	filter1.pdf	Upload Additional Price list of Filter papers etc (if any). (In case you do not have additional price list to upload or you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	183.59
18	Additional Documents	gases.pdf	Upload Price list of Gases here . (In case you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	182.73
19	Additional Documents	sequencingservices1.pdf	Upload Price list of Sequencing Services etc (if any). (In case you are not applying under this category then upload a blank pdf mentioning NO BID under this category)	182.25

Bid Openers List

S.No	Bid Opener Login Id	Bid Opener Name	Bid Opener Designation
1.	lalit.eproc@csir.res.in	Lalit Kumar Srivastav	EE
2.	prsoon.eproc@csir.res.in	Prasoon Mishra	SO
3.	rambadal.eproc@csir.res.in	Ram Badal	SO
4.	somnath.eproc@csir.res.in	Somanath Swain	AE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name	Dinesh Kumar
Address	Stores and Purchase Officer CSIR National Botanical Research Institute Rana Pratap Marg Lucknow 226001 Uttar Pradesh

Tender Creator Details

Created By	Dinesh Kumar
Designation	SPO
Created Date	10-Jul-2017 12:46 PM